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No Shows, Cancellations, & Payment for Services 

Client Name: 

When you schedule an appointment with our staff, West Texas Counseling & Guidance reserves that time just 
for you. If you are not going to attend your scheduled appointment, we would like to give another client the 
opportunity to take that opening. It affects our funding, our ability to budget our staff, and staff salaries when 
there are missed appointments. That is why we require 24-hour advance notification of cancellation. Leaving a 
message with our answering service is fine, even on weekends. The time you called will be posted with the 
message. If you do not give 24 hours’ notice before cancelling your appointment, do not show for your 
appointment, and/or are more than 15 minutes late more than two times in a three-month period, you may be 
asked to schedule with another therapist or moved to the WTCG wait list for services. Clients may also be 
charged a $50 missed fee prior to being seen again. If you are being seen for reduced fee and pay less than $50 
per session, the fee will be your usual session charge. Those seen without a session fee will be charged $5 per 
missed session. 
Clients with certain insurances cannot be billed the missed appointment fee - Medicaid, Employee Assistance 
Programs (EAP), or some private insurances. We appreciate the courtesy you extend to us by honoring this 
agreement. Please note that we cannot bill your insurance company for missed sessions or for late 
cancellations. All clients scheduled to be seen in the appointment must be present in order for the appointment 
to be considered kept (both partners for couples counseling, etc.)  

Certain insurances may not reimburse for some services offered at WTCG; in the event that insurance does not 
reimburse for a service provided and the client does not qualify for one of several client assistance programs at 
WTCG, the client will be held responsible for payment for that service.  

Counselor Discretion: The counselor may choose to continue to see the client without requiring same- day 
appointments. The counselor may also waive the $50 fee. 

Weather Related: Missed appointments due to dangerous weather will not count as a late cancellation. Due to 
the counselors maintaining a set schedule: 

• If you are 15 minutes late for 60-minute appointment, you may not be seen.

• If you are 10 minutes late for a 45-minute appointment, you may not be seen.

• If you are 5 minutes late for a 30-minute appointment, you may not be seen.

Court appearance: In the event disclosure of your records or the therapist’s testimony are requested by you or 
required by law, you will be responsible for the costs involved in producing the records and the therapist’s 
normal hourly rate of $104.00 for giving that testimony. If a clinician is required to travel to a court location out 
of town, per diem and mileage are additional costs that you will be responsible for.  Such payments are to be 
made prior to the time the services are rendered by the therapist.  

By signing this agreement, I acknowledge my understanding of all the policies listed above. I accept and agree to 
all of the above terms during the course of my treatment at West Texas Counseling & Guidance. 

Signature of Client/Parent or Guardian if the client is a minor Date 

Signature of WTCG Staff Date 
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